Solicitation Name: Janitorial Service Library
Solicitation #: 21747
Closed: 6/03/2021

#

Items

Total Cost
Selected #

Selected ($)
Lowest QuantityRe UnitMeasur UnitPrice TotalCost

All bright janitorial
service

)

0

S0

Coastal cleaning LLC
> 242,734.8000000000;
0
S0

UnitPrice TotalCost

Green Life Janitorial
S0

0
S0
UnitPrice TotalCost

Performance
Environmental
Services, LLC

> 210,807.5200000000:
0
S0

UnitPrice TotalCost

#1-1
#1-2
#1-3
#1-4
#1-5

#1-6

Ives Library Man Hours
Mitchell Man Hours
Stetson Man Hours
Wilson Man Hours
Fair Haven Man Hours

Roaming disinfectant cleaner

$105,268.: 5460
$24,061.4.1248
$15,038.41780

$30,076.81 1560
$20,051.2 1040

$16,310.8: 846

Hourly rate
Hourly rate
Hourly rate
Hourly rate
Hourly rate

Hourly rate

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$22.2
$22.2
$22.2
$22.2
$22.2

$222

$121,212.0 No Bid
$27,705.6 No Bid
$17,316.0 No Bid
$34,632.0 NoBid
$23,088.0 No Bid

$18,781.2 No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$19.28
$19.28
$19.28
$19.28
$19.28

$19.28

$105,268.8

$ 24,061.440000000002
$ 15,038.400000000001
$ 30,076.800000000003
$20,051.2

$ 16,310.880000000001
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