
Solicitation Name:On Call Sewer Line Maintenance and Service-Rebid
Solicitation # 21653 Total Cost
Closed 6/27/2019 Selected #

Selected ($)
# Items Lowest Quantity
ReUnit
of
Meas Unit
Price Total
Cost Unit
Price Total
Cost Unit
Price Total
Cost

1
#1-1 Regular Time Hours $ 6,500.0 100 hourly $ 65 $ 6,500.0 $ 90 $ 9,000.0 $ 73.40000 $ 7,340.000000000001
#1-2 Over Time Hours $ 750 10 hourly $ 75 $ 750 $ 130 $ 1,300.0 $ 83.2 $ 832.0
#1-3 Super Vac Truck,w/EO $ 175 1 hourly $ 210 $ 210 $ 175 $ 175 $ 181 $ 181

#1-4
Super Vac Truck,w/EO-OT-
Premium $ 225 1 hourly $ 225 $ 225 $ 225 $ 225 $ 230 $ 230

#1-5 Portable Pipe Jetter $ 50 1 hourly $ 125 $ 125 $ 50 $ 50 $ 122.5 $ 122.5

#1-6 Tow Behind Pipe Jetter  2"-4" line $ 150 1 hourly $ 175 $ 175 $ 150 $ 150 $ 181 $ 181

#1-7
Tow Behind Pipe Jetter  4" - 12"  
line $ 200 1 hourly $ 200 $ 200 $ 200 $ 200 $ 220.5 $ 220.5

#1-8 Pressure Washer 10K psi $ 90 1 hourly $ 100 $ 100 $ 90 $ 90 $ 142 $ 142
#1-9 Pressure Washer 3K psi $ 75 1 hourly $ 90 $ 90 $ 75 $ 75 $ 93 $ 93
#1-10 Utility Truck $ 47 1 hourly $ 50 $ 50 $ 50 $ 50 $ 47 $ 47

#1-11

TV Inspection Camera/with pipe 
location device (3' max. Variance) 
per clean out $ 98 1 lump sum $ 210 $ 210 $ 275 $ 275 $ 98 $ 98

#1-12
Locating pipe underground- per 
clean out $ 98 1 lump sum $ 260 $ 260 $ 275 $ 275 $ 98 $ 98

#1-13 Snake main line up to 100 feet $ 325 1 lump sum $ 335 $ 335 $ 325 $ 325 $ 680 $ 680
#1-14 Snake main line over 100' feet $ 5 1 per foot $ 7 $ 7 $ 5 $ 5 $ 15 $ 15

#1-15
Snake Secondary line up to 100 
feet (sinks/lavs, etc..) $ 175 1 lump sum $ 265 $ 265 $ 175 $ 175 $ 632 $ 632

#1-16 Remove/Reset Toilet $ 135 1 lump sum $ 135 $ 135 $ 200 $ 200 $ 142 $ 142
2

#2-1
Adult and Continuing Education 
Center $ 0 1 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-2 Cross High School $ 175.0 250 gal $ 0.8 $ 200.0 $ 0.7 $ 175.0 $ 0.78 $ 195.0
#2-3 Cross High School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-4 Wooster New  Light High School $ 0 1 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-5 Hillhouse High School $ 175.0 250 gal $ 0.8 $ 200.0 $ 0.7 $ 175.0 $ 0.78 $ 195.0
#2-6 Hillhouse High School $ 175.0 250 gal $ 0.8 $ 200.0 $ 0.7 $ 175.0 $ 0.78 $ 195.0
#2-7 Hillhouse High School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-8
New Horizons School for Higher 
Achievement $ 122.4 80 lb $ 2.5 $ 200.0 $ 2.25 $ 180.0 $ 1.53 $ 122.4

#2-9 Sound School-Anderson Bldg. $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-10 Aquaculture Center $ 250.25 1001 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.25 $ 0.27 $ 270.27000$ 0.59 $ 590.5899999999999

#2-11
Coop Arts & Humanities High 
School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-12
Engineering & Science University 
Magnet School $ 500.0 2500 gal $ 0.2 $ 500.0 $ 0.25 $ 625.0 $ 0.39 $ 975.0

#2-13 Hill Regional Career High School $ 122.4 80 lb $ 2.5 $ 200.0 $ 2.25 $ 180.0 $ 1.53 $ 122.4
#2-14 High School in the Community $ 122.4 80 lb $ 2.5 $ 200.0 $ 2.25 $ 180.0 $ 1.53 $ 122.4

#2-15 Metropolitan Business Academy $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-16 New Haven Academy $ 500.0 2500 gal $ 0.2 $ 500.0 $ 0.25 $ 625.0 $ 0.39 $ 975.0

#2-17
Riverside Education 
Academy/Domus Academy $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-18 Barnard Magnet School $ 345.0 1500 gal $ 0.23 $ 345.0 $ 0.26 $ 390.0 $ 0.54 $ 810.0
#2-19 Beecher School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-20 Betsy Ross Arts Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-21 Bishop Woods School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-22 Katherine Brennan School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-23 Clarence  Rogers School $ 93.2 40 lb $ 2.5 $ 100.0 $ 5 $ 200 $ 2.33 $ 93.2

#2-24
Celentano Museum 
Academy/Polly T. McCabe Center $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-25 Clemente Leadership Academy $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-26 Clinton Ave. School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-27 Columbus Family Academy $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-28 Conte West Hills Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-29 Davis Street Magnet School $ 93.2 40 lb $ 2.5 $ 100.0 $ 5 $ 200 $ 2.33 $ 93.2
#2-30 East Rock Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

0 0 0
$ 0 $ 0 $ 0

 ewer Drain & Jetting Se  ountry Septic Service, l Tri State
$ 23,527.25 $ 27,710.27 $ 39,110.39000000001



#2-31 Edgewood Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-32 Fair haven School $ 575.0 2500 gal $ 0.23 $ 575.0 $ 0.25 $ 625.0 $ 0.39 $ 975.0
#2-33 Hill Central Music Academy $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-34 W.Hooker Elementary School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-35 W. Hooker School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-36 Jepson Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-37 John C. Daniels Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-38 John S. Martinez Magnet School $ 345.0 1500 gal $ 0.23 $ 345.0 $ 0.27 $ 405.0 $ 0.54 $ 810.0
#2-39 King/Robinson Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-40 Dr. Reginal Mayo School $ 570.0 3000 gal $ 0.19 $ 570.0 $ 0.25 $ 750.0 $ 0.39 $ 1,170.0
#2-41 Lincoln-Bassett School $ 122.4 80 lb $ 2.5 $ 200.0 $ 2.25 $ 180.0 $ 1.53 $ 122.4

#2-42 Mauro/Sheridan Magnet School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-43

Micro Society Magnet 
School/West Rock Writers 
Academy $ 122.4 80 lbs $ 2.5 $ 200.0 $ 2.25 $ 180.0 $ 1.53 $ 122.4

#2-44 Nathan Hale School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-45 Quinnipiac School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-46 Elm City  Montessori $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-47 Ross/Woodward School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-48 Strong School @ Mauro $ 0 1 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-49 Troup School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-50
Truman School/Truman Head 
Start Program $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0

#2-51 Wexler/Grant School $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-52 Elm City Montessorri $ 250.0 1000 gal $ 0.25 $ 250.0 $ 0.27 $ 270.0 $ 0.59 $ 590.0
#2-53 The Shack $ 122.4 80 lbs $ 2.5 $ 200.0 $ 2.25 $ 180.0 $ 1.53 $ 122.4
#2-54 Central Kitchen $ 805.0 3500 gal $ 0.23 $ 805.0 $ 0.23 $ 805.0 $ 0.39 $ 1,365.0
#2-55 Floyd Little Fieldhouse $ 0 1 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-56 Parish Hall $ 0 1 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-57 NHPS BoE Executive Offices $ 0 1 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#2-58 Adult Education $ 0 1 NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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